
  
OFFICE OF THE CITY CLERK 
 

 
SUSTAINABILITY AND TRANSPORTATION 

COMMITTEE  
 
March 9, 2023 
 
The Sustainability and Transportation Committee of the City of Mesa met in the lower-level meeting 
room of the Council Chambers, 57 East 1st Street, on March 9, 2023, at 8:36 a.m. 
 
 
COMMITTEE PRESENT 

 
COMMITTEE ABSENT 

 
STAFF PRESENT 

   
Alicia Goforth, Chairperson None Candace Cannistraro 
Francisco Heredia 
Jennifer Duff 
 

 Marc Heirshberg 
Holly Moseley 
Bill Taebel 

   
Chairperson Goforth conducted a roll call.  

 
1. Items from citizens present. 
  

There were no items from citizens present. 
 
2-a.  Hear a presentation, discuss, and provide an update on Mesa's Shared Use Path system. 

 
Transportation Department Director RJ Zeder introduced Engineering Supervisor Sabine King 
and Deputy Transportation Director Erik Guderian, and displayed a PowerPoint presentation. 
(See Attachment 1) 
 
Mr. Guderian provided an overview of the current active transportation network and future 
projects. He described the two different types of infrastructure and costs for bicyclists and 
pedestrian use, most of which are built along Salt River Project (SRP) canals and the Arizona 
Department of Transportation (ADOT) right-of-way. He explained that complete streets are 
wider sidewalk systems to accommodate pedestrian traffic or higher-level bike lanes. He added 
the cost of the projects varies based on the type of improvements and changes to curb lines. 
(See Pages 2 and 3 of Attachment 1)  
 
In response to multiple questions from Chairperson Goforth, Mr. Guderian responded that the 
Shared Use Paths are paved; however, the City has many unpaved pathways which are not 
under the City’s jurisdiction for maintenance. He explained by law, SRP’s canals are required to 
be open for recreational use since SRP has the right through the Bureau of Reclamation. He 
stated the City has chosen to use paved pathways in order to benefit all users, as well as its 
accessibility for individuals with disabilities. 
 
Mr. Zeder clarified that the large variance in pricing is due to the assessment of underground 
improvements, including the possibility of curb line changes or drain changes to the storm 
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system. He emphasized that the stadium connector, which connects two baseball stadiums, 
was a substantial capital project due to the need to lay curbs in the street. 
 
In response to a question posed by Chairperson Goforth, Mr. Zeder affirmed that moving a curb 
narrows the road and is costly. He described a small project without changing a curb in which a 
separate bike lane was constructed with plastic delineators at a lower cost.  
 
Mr. Guderian presented a map illustrating the existing networks of projects and their locations. 
He shared the City was able to make the connections due to the 2020 Bond Initiative, and the 
Mesa Moves Bond program. He added the City was able to set aside $20 million for active 
transportation projects, which have specifically concentrated on the eastern canal. He discussed 
upcoming projects and studies to determine the best way to connect bicyclists and pedestrians 
in Downtown Mesa. He noted the results of the study will be brought back to Council for 
consideration. (See Page 4 of Attachment 1) 
 
In response to multiple questions from Chairperson Goforth, Mr. Guderian responded that the 
eastern canal relates to the Roosevelt Water Conservation District (RWCD) canal. He explained 
in the past, the RWCD did not allow any pathways along their canal but after recent discussions, 
the RWCD will allow it.  
 
Mr. Guderian discussed the future networks and the development of the Active Transportation 
Network. He mentioned some of the upcoming projects are to create a loop around Mesa using 
the 202 freeway system, north/south connections along the canals, and east/west connections 
within the central part of Mesa. He stated studies have been conducted to determine other 
connection locations in Mesa. He referenced a map illustrating future signal locations for safer 
crossings at the canals. (See Page 5 of Attachment 1) 
 
In response to a question from Chairperson Goforth, Mr. Zeder stated the City’s goal in the 
eastern canal is to have signalized crossing locations where the canal crosses the arterial 
street. 
 
In response to multiple questions posed by Chairperson Goforth, Mr. Zeder commented the City 
has not been able to reach an agreement regarding the Central Arizona Project (CAP) canal 
due to requirements that are beyond the bounds of Mesa’s project. He reported the City 
prioritizes opportunities for building based on the need and the availability of funds. He 
elaborated the Mesa Gateway path is expected to connect with existing paths in Gilbert, as well 
as neighboring cities, allowing individuals to ride beyond the borders of Mesa. He explained that 
the long-term vision may be 20 years or longer and depends on the availability of funding and 
partners allowing further expansion. 
 
Discussion ensued relative to the Shared Use Paths system, funding, partnerships, impact fees, 
collector streets, and the future network. 
 
Chairperson Goforth thanked staff for the presentation. 
 

2-b.  Hear a presentation, discuss, and provide an update on the Transportation Master Plan. 
 
Transportation Department Director RJ Zeder introduced Engineering Supervisor Sabine King 
and Deputy Transportation Director Erik Guderian, and displayed a PowerPoint presentation. 
(See Attachment 2) 
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Ms. King provided an overview of the Transportation Master Plan (TMP) and the resources 
utilized. She explained Mesa will be fully developed by 2050, and the City will have the 
opportunity to review whether Mesa has any additional capacity for vehicles and how to utilize 
that extra space in right-of-ways to benefit other users. (See Page 2 of Attachment 2) 
 
Ms. King reviewed a variety of sources from which the TMP receives information and the impact 
on funds and future developments. She mentioned that every 10 years the TMP is updated due 
to changes and growth in the city. (See Pages 3 through 5 of Attachment 2) 
 
Ms. King compared the TMPs for 2040 and 2050 for a comprehensive overview. She mentioned 
the focus is on data collection and she requested that everyone complete a survey and 
participate in outreach efforts, which can have a significant impact on the future. She stated the 
2050 plan will be coordinated with other groups within the city. (See Page 6 of Attachment 2) 
 
In response to a question posed by Chairperson Goforth, Mr. Guderian stated the 
Transportation Department wants to continue with a complete streets concept to accommodate 
pedestrians, bicycles, and vehicles on the streets. He advised the City will take into account the 
context of the surrounding land use and the location and determine options available. 
 
In response to a question from Chairperson Goforth, Mr. Zeder clarified that the use of a street 
must be determined by its context, and a six-lane arterial street is able to accommodate all 
users. He explained despite the City’s desire to accommodate all users, some areas will have a 
higher vehicle use, and other areas will have greater pedestrians or bicycle use.  
 
Ms. King presented a map showing the study network for Mesa’s city limits. She explained the 
Transportation Department is reviewing key local streets and neighborhoods to determine 
connectivity with Mesa’s network in order to accommodate all users. (See Page 7 of Attachment 
2) 
 
Ms. King discussed the key deliverables and outcomes of the TMP. She stated complete street 
principles and connectivity should be applied throughout the entire network; and the 
Transportation Department should ensure that all different elements, neighborhood feedback, 
and input are reviewed and incorporated into the model that the City is developing when 
determining project priorities. She emphasized the ultimate objective is to integrate the General 
Plan and Transit Plan to create a connected multimodal transportation plan. (See Page 8 of 
Attachment 2) 
 
Ms. King summarized the study schedule for the Transportation Plan update. She explained the 
existing and future conditions assessment is based on data from the General Plan, Maricopa 
Association of Government, as well as traffic volumes and data collection. She indicated in 
order to receive the necessary feedback, a strong emphasis is placed on community 
engagement throughout all the phases. (See Page 9 of Attachment 2) 
 
In response to a question from Committeemember Heredia, Ms. King responded that part of the 
Transportation Plan is dedicated to researching future technologies and operations.  
 
In response to a question posed by Committeemember Heredia, Vamshi Yellisetty, consultant 
with Kittelson & Associates, stated that the City engages with various stakeholders as part of 
each phase of outreach. He explained the emerging technology providers and vendors are 
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invited to join the City of Mesa (COM) to collaborate and the COM incorporates the information 
into their future planning.  
 
In response to a question from Committeemember Duff, Mr. Zeder reported that the 
Transportation Department has two employees who are heavily involved in the review of 
development plans daily.  
 
Committeemember Duff stressed the importance of mobile hubs, walkable areas, and 
transportation connections in the city.  
 
Chairperson Goforth thanked staff for the presentation. 
 

2-c.  Hear a presentation, discuss, and provide an update on the Transit Master Plan. 
 
Transit Services Director Jodi Sorrell displayed a PowerPoint presentation on updates to the 
Transit Master Plan. She explained that transit improves the quality of life and reduces traffic 
congestion; one bus replaces 30-35 cars from the road. She added there is a social equity 
benefit that provides economic growth in the development occurring in Downtown, much of 
which is the result of the light rail construction project that brought light rail to Downtown and 
ensures a sustainable future for the COM. She noted Valley Metro is considering electric and 
hydrogen powered buses for the future to promote sustainability in a variety of ways. (See 
Attachment 3) 
 
Ms. Sorrell reviewed the timeline for the Transit Master Plan and noted that half of Mesa’s 
community has a robust transit system. She explained the various transit options considered for 
some parts of the city based on their needs. (See Page 2 of Attachment 3)  
 
Ms. Sorrell reported the Transit Department has been involved with community outreach, and 
one of the major components of the plan is geared for the youth. She pointed out high school 
and college students have been identified as the prime target audience for the Transit Master 
Plan. (See Page 3 of Attachment 3)  
 
Ms. Sorrell discussed the key takeaways from the leadership interviews for making the existing 
network as productive as possible. She commented on the usage of feedback from the public 
survey and encouraged participation from residents. (See Pages 4 and 5 of Attachment 3)  
 
Ms. Sorrell reported Pinnacle Prevention is a nonprofit organization based in Chandler and 
received a Maricopa County Public Health grant to connect individuals to food deserts in the 
area. She mentioned the City is partnering with Pinnacle Prevention to share information to 
ensure the success of both projects. (See Page 6 of Attachment 3)  
 
Ms. Sorrell shared the current conditions of the transit system and the bus operator survey. She 
commented the results will be forwarded to the team in charge of the TMP. She summarized the 
feedback from bus drivers and included the next steps to finalizing the Transit Master Plan. She 
provided a link for a transit rider survey. (See Pages 7 through 10 of Attachment 3)  
 
In response to a question from Chairperson Goforth, Ms. Sorrell remarked she met with 
Pinnacle Prevention and identified other nonprofit organizations the City should contact.  
 



Sustainability and Transportation 
Committee 
March 9, 2023 
Page 5 

In response to a question posed by Committeemember Heredia, Ms. Sorrell advised that the 
City intends to identify additional opportunities for a potential microtransit system, and discussed 
a demonstration circulator project that provided access to a community without bus service. She 
mentioned the idea is to operate within an eight-foot square mile that connects into a regional 
system. She stated the Superstition Springs Transit Center is Mesa’s largest transit center. She 
pointed out that a component of the Transit Master Plan for East Mesa will be to identify 
emerging markets that would be appropriate for transit and a funding source, as well as identify 
areas that would benefit from a microtransit system. 

Chairperson Goforth thanked staff for the presentation. 

2-d.  Hear a presentation, discuss, and provide an update on the Grass-to-Xeriscape program.

Energy Resources and Sustainability Director Scott Bouchie introduced Energy/Water 
Conservation Coordinator Becky Zusy and displayed a PowerPoint presentation. (See 
Attachment 4) 

Ms. Zusy explained the Environmental and Sustainability Department administers, promotes, 
and implements the water conservation incentive program. 

Ms. Zusy provided a history of the Grass-to-Xeriscape landscape incentive. She discussed 
three updates that were implemented in 2019. She mentioned the enhancement from a rebate 
to an incentive was partly to encourage residents to save water and promote sustainability. (See 
Pages 2 through 5 of Attachment 4)  

Ms. Zusy discussed the increased incentive amounts and reviewed the participation levels. (See 
Page 6 of Attachment 4) 

Ms. Zusy outlined the resources available for customers participating in the program. She 
mentioned the City refers residents to Mesa’s website, as well as the Water - Use It Wisely 
website, and guides residents through the process. (See Page 7 of Attachment 4) 

Ms. Zusy presented the leading factors that motivated residents to apply to the program. She 
reported participation in the program has significantly increased since 2019. (See Pages 8 and 
9 of Attachment 4) 

In response to a question posed by Chairperson Goforth, Ms. Zusy responded that the growth in 
participation is partially due to the increased incentives, promotions, and media stories on water 
conservation. 

Ms. Zusy commented that there has been a lot of interest from residents in the program since 
May of 2022, as a result of the City declaring a Stage 1 water shortage through media coverage 
and social media. (See Page 10 of Attachment 4) 

Ms. Zusy reported the residential results of the program, including the number of homes that 
have completed conversions, the square footage of grass removal, and the cumulative savings 
of gallons of water. (See Page 11 of Attachment 4) 

Ms. Zusy stated the City also offers incentive options for commercial, homeowners association 
(HOA), and non-residential customers. She presented an example of an HOA that took 



Sustainability and Transportation 
Committee 
March 9, 2023 
Page6 

3. 

advantage of the program and achieved cost savings. She emphasized the Planning and 
Engineering departments support the program and ensures the requirements are met. (See 
Pages 12 and 13 of Attachment 4) 

In response to a question from Chairperson Goforth, Ms. Zusy stated that commercial and 
residential properties must be approved prior to proceeding through the process. 

Ms. Zusy described the irrigation efficiency upgrades for commercial or non-residential 
customers. She indicated prior to 2019, the program was funded with federal grant money; after 
2019, the City is funding the program. She mentioned since January 2023, there has been an 
increased amount of interest in the program from commercial and non-residential customers. 
(See Pages 14 and 15 of Attachment 4) 

In response to a question from Chairperson Goforth, Ms. Zusy commented that interest in the 
program is widespread throughout Mesa. She added Dobson Ranch has a high level of 
participation largely due to their major interest in self-promotion. 

In response to a question posed by Committeemember Heredia, Mr. Bouchie stated as a result 
of the increased interest in the program, the City added a staff member and changed the 
Coordinator position from part-time to full-time. He mentioned he will continue to track the 
number of incentives processed and determine if additional funding is needed to support the 
program. 

Chairperson Goforth thanked staff for the presentation. 

Adjournment. 

Without objection, the Sustainability and Transportation Committee meeting adjourned at 10:08 
a.m.

I hereby certify that the foregoing minutes are a true and correct copy of the minutes of the 
Sustainability and Transportation Committee meeting of Mesa, Arizona, held on the 9th day of March 
2023. I further certify that the meeting was duly called and held and that a quorum was present. 

Ir 
(Attachment - 4) 
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https://aecom.sharepoint.com/sites/BDEfforts-CityofTucson/Shared%20Documents/General/City%20of%20Tucson%20-%20Norte%20Sur%20Project%20.docx?web=1
https://aecom.sharepoint.com/sites/BDEfforts-CityofTucson/Shared%20Documents/General/City%20of%20Tucson%20-%20Norte%20Sur%20Project%20.docx?web=1
https://aecom.sharepoint.com/sites/BDEfforts-CityofTucson/Shared%20Documents/General/City%20of%20Tucson%20-%20Norte%20Sur%20Project%20.docx?web=1
https://aecom.sharepoint.com/sites/BDEfforts-CityofTucson/Shared%20Documents/General/City%20of%20Tucson%20-%20Norte%20Sur%20Project%20.docx?web=1
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C
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Strengthening Access and C
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Through Transit-oriented Solutions 

•
M

aricopa C
ounty D

epartm
ent of Public H

ealth grant
••

Led by Pinnacle Prevention -a non-profit organization
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Elderly passengers depend on bus service for grocery trips.

•
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inary transit solutions.

5.
C

ontinue project coordination efforts.


C
elebrate M

esa D
ay (April 15)


U

rban Lab W
orkshop (M

ay) 

6.
Launch Transit M

aster Plan O
nline Survey 2 (M

ay/June).
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G
et Involved

Take a Survey!

10

Survey W
eblinks

English version -https://w
w

w.surveym
onkey.com

/r/H
ZXFFB3

Spanish version -https://w
w

w.surveym
onkey.com

/r/C
H

B7D
6L

https://www.surveymonkey.com/r/HZXFFB3
https://www.surveymonkey.com/r/CHB7D6L
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C
ity of M

esa
TR

A
N

SIT M
A

STER
 PLA

N

T
hank You!
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W
ater C

onservation 
Incentive Program

s
Becky Zusy

C
onservation C

oord
inator

Environm
ental and

 Sustainability D
epartm

ent
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Resid
ential G

rass-to-Xeriscape 
Land

scape Incentive
•

In 2007, sta
ff crea

ted
 this p

rogra
m

 to p
rom

ote w
a

ter conserva
tion a

nd
 to 

red
uce the a

m
ount of gra

ss in M
esa

•
$500 for rem

oving a
t lea

st 500 sq
ua

re feet of living, hea
lthy gra

ss

•
Req

uired
 a

 m
inim

um
 of 50 p

ercent covera
ge b

y low
 w

a
ter use p

la
nts in 

the gra
ss conversion a

rea

2
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2019 Upd
ate #

1 –
Trees are C

ool
•

M
a

ny p
a

rticip
a

nts w
ere not includ

ing trees in their 
conversion d

esigns

•
Trees a

re C
ool w

a
s crea

ted
 a

s a
n a

d
d

itiona
l incentive 

to p
a

rticip
a

nts in the G
ra

ss-to-Xerisca
p

e p
rogra

m
 for 

a
d

d
ing trees

•
O

ne tree w
a

s a
n a

d
d

itiona
l $50 or $75 for tw

o trees 

•
Low

 w
a

ter use trees sa
ve w

a
ter com

p
a

red
 w

ith gra
ss

•
Trees could

 b
e a

nyw
here on the p

rop
erty to receive 

the incentive

•
Sup

p
orts the new

 cityw
id

e tree p
la

nting initia
tive

3
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2019 Upd
ate #

2 –
Enhanced

 C
oncepts

•
N

ot a
 “reb

a
te” a

nym
ore –

it is now
 a

n 
“incentive,” d

esigned
 to encoura

ge 
certa

in req
uirem

ents for environm
enta

l 
b

enefits

•
Prom

otion of susta
ina

bility goa
ls

•
C

rea
ting sha

d
e

•
Im

p
roving a

ir q
ua

lity
•

Provid
e w

ildlife ha
b

ita
t

•
A

d
d

ed
 survey to d

iscover m
otiva

tions to 
b

etter ta
ilor p

rom
otion

4
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2019 Upd
ate #

3 –
O

nline Q
uestionnaire

•
To im

p
rove efficiency a

nd
 crea

te grea
ter 

und
ersta

nd
ing, sta

ff crea
ted

 a
n online 

q
uestionnaire tha

t m
ust b

e a
nsw

ered
 

before applying.

•
N

ew
 a

na
lytics on how

 m
a

ny p
eop

le a
re 

filling out the q
uestionnaire, a

nd
 w

ha
t 

their resp
onses a

re 

5

LRivera
Text Box
Sustainability and Transportation Committee
March 9, 2023
Attachment 4
Page 5 of 16




2023 Upd
ate –

Increased
 Incentive

•
Tw

o participation levels


500 –
999 sq ft of grass rem

oved
 = $750


1,000+ sq ft of grass = $1,000

•
Trees are C

ool -$50 for one tree, $100 for tw
o

B
efore

A
fter

7 Y
ears 

A
fter

6
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Resources for C
ustom

ers
O

nline assistance
•

Low
 w

ater use plant selection
•

Understanding Xeriscape
•

Tree installation
•

W
atering schedules

•
D

esign tips
•

G
rass rem

oval

Personalized em
ail to every custom

er at every stage 
•

N
ew

 application received
•

First inspection com
plete

•
Responding to custom

er questions (there are generally m
any!)

•
Final inspection and paym

ent inform
ation

7
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0%

10%

20%

30%

40%

50%

60%

70%

80%

90%

100%

Saving W
ater

Less M
aintenance

Saving M
oney

C
reate Shade

Prefer D
esert Look

O
ther

M
otiva

tions for A
pplying for 

G
ra

ss-to-Xerisca
pe La

nd
sca

pe Incentive

2022/2023 (YTD
)

2021/2022
2020/2021

O
verall A

verage

8

LRivera
Text Box
Sustainability and Transportation Committee
March 9, 2023
Attachment 4
Page 8 of 16




Increased
 Participation

0 20 40 60 80
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FY 2019/2020
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FY 2021/2022
FY 2022/2023 (Thru Feb '23)

Tota
l G

ra
ss-to-Xerisca

p
e La

nd
sca

p
e Incentive A

ctivity
(Resid

ential)

Total Y
early A

ctivity for G
rass-to-X

eriscape A
pplicants

Jan - Feb 2023 O
nly
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Increased
 Participation

0
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A
pr

M
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A
ug

Sept
O
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N
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D
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N
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Q
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2020
2021

2022
2023

*Prom
otion of 

Increa
sed

 Incentive 
A

m
ounts

*D
ecla

red
 Shorta

ge 
Sta

ge O
ne
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Resid
ential Results By the N

um
bers

•
Since 2007, m

ore than 500 hom
es have com

pleted
 their conversions

•
M

ore than 466,000 square feet of grass have been rem
oved

 (10.7 acres)
•

Estim
ated

 cum
ulative savings of 71,000,000 gallons of w

ater
•

Since 2019, 120 trees have been planted
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C
om

m
ercia

l/H
O

A
/N

on-Resid
entia

l 
Incentive O

p
tions

•
U

p
to

 $12,500
•

G
ra

ss-to
-Xe

risc
a

p
e

 La
nd

sc
a

p
e

 Inc
e

ntive
•

Irrig
a

tio
n Eq

uip
m

e
nt Inc

e
ntive

  

B
efore

A
fter

$12,500
C

om
m

ercial

12
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C
om

m
ercia

l/H
O

A
 G

ra
ss Rem

ova
l

•
M

inim
um

 of 10,000 sq ft of grass
•

Sim
ilar requirem

ents to resid
ential program

13
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C
om

m
ercia

l/H
O

A
/N

on-Resid
entia

l 
Irriga

tion Efficiency

•
High Efficiency N

ozzles
•

Valve Pressure Regulators
•

Pressure Regulating Heads

•
Sm

art C
ontrollers

•
Flow

 Sensors
•

Rain Sensors
14
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C
om

m
ercial/HO

A
/N

on-Resid
ential 

Results By the N
um

bers
•

2010 –
2018: federal grant m

oney


351,000 sq
ua

re feet of gra
ss rem

oved


7 p
a

rticipa
nts in the irriga

tion eq
uip

m
ent p

rogra
m


20 H

O
A

s, 2 non-p
rofits, 6 a

p
a

rtm
ent com

m
unities, 3 b

usinesses p
a

rticipa
ted

•
2019 –

present: C
ity budget


58,000 sq

ua
re feet of gra

ss rem
oved


2 p

a
rticipa

nts in the irriga
tion eq

uip
m

ent p
rogra

m


4 H
O

A
s p

a
rticipa

ted


Estim
a

ted
 a

nnua
l w

a
ter sa

vings: 928,000 ga
llons

•
Increased interest in 2023


Since Ja
nua

ry, inq
uiries from

 m
ore tha

n 20 
non-resid

ential custom
ers 


4 a

ctive a
p

p
lica

tions

15
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Q
uestions?

Becky Zusy
C

onservation C
oordinator

Environm
ental and Sustainability Departm

ent
M

esaaz.gov/conservation
16
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